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Most drug rehabilitation facilities treat cocaine addiction using the 
same traditional approach, typically through 12-step programs or drug 
therapy. Vista Bay Drug Rehab is different, employing an 
individualized, all natural, holistic program that has led to a 
remarkable success rate in helping people recover from the ravages of 
cocaine addiction. While other clinics frequently see repeat patients, 
Vista Bay offers clients an additional 30 days of treatment should they 
relapse within six months. In recognition of the work it does in helping 
victims to overcome cocaine addiction, Congress granted the 
Congressional Certificate of Special Recognition to Narconon, the 
organization that operates Vista Bay Rehab. 

February, 2010 - Video footage posted on YouTube offers the public a 
rare glimpse at Narconon Vista Bay Rehab, a drug and alcohol 
treatment center that's renowned worldwide for its holistic cocaine 
addiction recovery program. Vista Bay Drug Rehab is not the sort of 
facility that's in the spotlight, despite the fact that Narconon has built 
a reputation for highly effective holistic treatment programs for over 
40 years. While the facility is highly regarded (with recognition that 
extends to being awarded a Congressional Certificate), the staff is 
content to let the center's success in helping patients finally overcome 
their addictions speak for itself. 

Brandon (his last name is with held to protect his identity), a 22 year 
old who fought addictions to cocaine, marijuana and alcohol, is a 



typical success story. After years of substance abuse, doctors told him 
he had suffered permanent nerve damage. He was literally throwing 
his life away. He enrolled at vistabay, hoping to turn his life around, 
and after graduation wrote: 

“I have been clean now for five months, and I will continue on this 
track for the rest of my life... I feel blessed that the Narconon program 
saved my life and I have learned to live life, instead of letting my 
environment (sic) have a negative effect on me.” 

There have been thousands of other patients like Brandon. Watching 
the video on YouTube, where a graduate of the program recounts 
everything he's gained since completing treatment, including reaching 
the stage where he's able to set and achieve goals in his life, is 
poignant and helps to put a human face on why Narconon expends so 
much effort in helping people overcome addictions. 

Vista Bay Drug Rehab Center is different from most other drug rehab 
clinics. The patient is the priority and the treatment program for each 
patient is customized to meet their individual needs. An all natural, 
holistic approach to cocaine addiction is employed, rather than the 
clinical treatment that most centers rely on and the success rate of 
Vista Bay Rehab supports the idea that holistic treatment is a superior 
method. 

Narconon has offered drug addiction rehabilitation for over 40 years 
and the cocaine addiction program at Vista Bay Rehab continues to 
gain recognition for its success rate. Even though 30 days of additional 
treatment are offered should a patient suffer a relapse within six 
months of graduating from the program, the staff is seldom called 
upon to make good on this promise. Based in California, with a 
beautiful and well equipped facility (which can be seen on the 
YouTube video), Vista Bay Drug Rehab is truly a permanent solution to 
cocaine addiction and other substance abuse issues. 
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