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26 May 2010 – Popular consumer money-saving site 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk this week introduces a range of money-saving 
retail codes to help Brits save on clothing, DIY gear and more this 
summer. As the UK climate warms up ahead of the summer season 
shoppers are profiting from the deals to be had at more than 300 
leading stores listed on the site. 

Currently on show on the website are bargains galore for women and 
men’s summer styles thanks to new vouchers redeemable at White 
Stuff. DiscountVouchers.co.uk has vouchers available this week for 
£13 off a Gymnasium Zip Hoody, £23 off Buxham Knit Longsleeved 
Tops and also offers on women’s skirts. 

DiscountVouchers.co.uk regularly updates the money-saving deals on 
its site to ensure that shoppers get the best merchant voucher 
codes all the time. For this week and the summer season the website 
is offering vouchers redeemable against DIY equipment at B&Q and 
HomeBase, and there are bargains to be had like £15 off camping and 
caravanning gear from Argos and also £5 off a purchase of £50 or 
more at TescoDirect. 

Simon Terry, managing director of DiscountVouchers.co.uk, 
comments, “With the weather warming up in the UK and people’s 
thoughts turning to summer this year we can help people to save on 



top fashions, DIY kit and much more besides with our latest range of 
bargain deals launched this week.” 

Other popular stores and retailers are included in the new range of 
deals on the site including popular website ASOS, the online service 
where shoppers can buy clothing and items they’ve seen in movies 
and on TV. DiscountVouchers.co.uk currently has available free 
delivery from ASOS on all orders over £75. 

DiscountVouchers.co.uk is home to a regularly updated range of 
vouchers and codes for savings at stores such as Boots, Currys, John 
Lewis, Sainsbury’s, Lastminute.com, Dorothy Perkins, New Look and 
more. The website is searchable by retailer name, latest deal and most 
popular deal, making it easier for customers to find the best value 
deals in the shortest time. 

To see all the latest discount deals visit www.discountvouchers.co.uk. 

/ends. 

About DiscountVouchers.co.uk 
DiscountVouchers.co.uk features the latest offers and savings from a 
growing range of retailers, all updated in real time. Designed to help 
consumers save money with both leading high street brands and 
specialist retailers, DiscountVouchers.co.uk offers one of the widest 
choices of money saving offers. 

Part of ASAP Ventures Ltd, the company behind the award winning 
Carrentals.co.uk price comparison site, DiscountVouchers.co.uk is 
committed to offering a growing range of the best savings available 
online. 

For more information visit www.discountvouchers.co.uk 
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