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eMaint Enterprises is proud to announce the acquisition of several new 
clients, the Johnson County School District,Fort Payne Water, and 
National Oilwell Varco. 

 

The maintenance team at Johnson County School District will use the 
eMaint X3 online CMMS software to support vehicle maintenance 
through planned maintenance, corrective maintenance and reporting. 
eMaint was selected for its configurability, ease-of-use, and strong 
work order and preventative maintenance capabilities. 

Fort Payne Water has selected X3 Online for managing plant and 
system maintenance. Team leaders determined that X3 online offered 
the best opportunity to meet their reliability goals while 
managing work order needs, PM's and running reports. Other points 
for selection included the system's ease-of-use, web-hosted access 
and user definable configuration. 



National Oilwell Varco has selected the eMaint X3 Online system to 
manage preventive maintenance operations at its R&D Lab in Houston, 
TX. Primary reasons for selecting eMaint included the web-hosted 
format, easy-to-use PM system, and built in reporting and dashboard 
features. Visit the eMaint website for information and screen shots of 
preventive maintenance for Tracking and Scheduling. 

eMaint is a visionary SaaS company leading in the development of 
next generation on demand solutions for maintenance and asset 
management. Established in 1986, eMaint was among the first, if not 
the first, providers of CMMS (Computerized Maintenance Management) 
systems to embrace the power of the Internet. First released in 1998, 
eMaint's on demand platform for maintenance management was 
designed around a passion for helping customers succeed. Combining 
high-performance design excellence and customer-driven innovations, 
our on-demand CMMS solution, eMaint X3, enables organizations 
across the globe to manage and control maintenance and repair 
operations for greater productivity and profitability. 
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